TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

F.O0.B. PRICES

3/4" ITEM 4 GRAVEL
11/4" ITEM 4 GRAVEL
WASHED SAND
SCREENED TOP SOIL
BANK RUN GRAVEL
TAILINGS

3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL - ITEM 4

** PRIMARY VENDOR

(1371 MILES)  (19.6 MILES)
HARLEM RED WING
VALLEYS&G PROPERTIES

$16.00 / TON NO BID
$17.00 / TON NO BID
$14.50 / TON*  $11.00 / TON
NO BID NO BID
$13.50/TON  $10.00/TON
$14.50/ TON  $12.00/TON
NO BID $16.00 / TON

(26 MILES )
COLARUSSO
S8
NO BID
NO BID
$15.50 / TON
NO BID
NO BID
$13.00/ TON

NO BID



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

DELIVERED PRICES

3/4" ITEM 4 GRAVEL
11/4" ITEM 4 GRAVEL
WASHED SAND
SCREENED TOP SOIL
BANK RUN GRAVEL
TAILINGS

3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL - ITEM 4

** PRIMARY VENDOR

COLARUSSO HARLEM
NO BID $21.00/ TON
NO BID $22.50 / TON

$24.50/ TON $19.50 / TON
NO BID NO BID
NO BID $18.50 / TON

$22.00/ TON $20.00/ TON
NO BID NO BID

RED WING

NO BID
NO BID
$18.00 / TON**
NO BID
$17.00/ TON
$19.00/ TON

$23.00/ TON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

(13.71 MILES ) (19.6 MILES ) (26 MILES )
) HARLEM RED WING COLARUSSO
GRAVEL STONE (FOB) VALLEY S & G PROPERTIES S&G
1/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $13.00 / TON NO BID NO BID
3/8" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $20.00 / TON NO BID NO BID
3/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $20.00 / TON NO BID NO BID
1 1/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $21.00/ TON NO BID NO BID
1/4" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" WASHED STONE NO BID $15.00 / TON NO BID
1/2" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID $14.00 / TON
3/4" WASHED STONE NO BID $15.00 / TON NO BID
1" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID NO BID
11/2" WASHED STONE NO BID $15.00 / TON NO BID
1/4" STONE NO BID NO BID $14.00 / TON
3/4" STONE NO BID NO BID $14.00 / TON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

HARLEM RED WING COLARUSSO
GRAVEL STONE DELIVERED VALLEYS &G PROPERTIES S&G
1/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $18.50/ TON NO BID NO BID
3/8" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $25.00/ TON NO BID NO BID
3/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $25.00 / TON NO BID NO BID
1 1/4" WASHED CRUSHED STONE $26.00/ TON NO BID . NC BID
1/4" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" WASHED STONE NQO BID $22.00/ TON NO BID
1/2" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID $23.00/ TON
3/4" WASHED STONE NO BID $22.00/ TON NO BID
1" WASHED STONE NO BID NO BID NO BID
11/2" WASHED STONE NO BID $22.00/ TON NO BID
1/4" STONE NO BID NO BID $23.00/ TON
3/4" STONE NO BID NO BID $23.00/ TON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

QUARRY STONE

CRUSHED STONE PRICES (FOB)

1/4" WASHED STONE

3/8" WASHED STONE

1/2" WASHED STONE

3/4" WASHED STONE

1 1/4" WASHED STONE

1/2" & 3/4" MIXED WASHED STONE
3/4" STONE

1 1/4" STONE

11/2" STONE

SCREENINGS (STONE DUST)
SCREENFILL

ITEM #4 (CRUSHER RUN)
GABION STONE (6"-10")
SURGE STONE (8" MINUS )
LIGHT STONE FILL (4"-10")
MEDIUM STONE FILL

HEAVY STONE FILL

(27 MILES)

COLARUSSO

$15.00 / TON
NO BID
$14.50 / TON
NO BID
NO BID
$14.25/ TON
$14.00 / TON
NO BID
$14.00 / TON
$11.50 / TON
$11.50 / TON
$12.50 / TON
$14.50 / TON
$14.00 / TON
NO BID
$16.50 / TON

$17.50 / TON

(28 MILES)
PECKHAM

$18.75/ TON
$17.85/ TON
NO BID
$17.85/ TON
$17.85/ TON
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$16.80/ TON
NO BID
NO BID
$23.00/ TON
$29.75/ TON

$29.75/TON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

QUARRY STONE

CRUSHED STONE PRICES DELIVERED

1/4" WASHED STONE

3/8" WASHED STONE

1/2" WASHED STONE

3/4" WASHED STONE

1 1/4" WASHED STONE

1/2" & 3/4" MIXED WASHED STONE
3/4" STONE

11/4" STONE

11/2" STONE

SCREENINGS (STONE DUST)
SCREENFILL

ITEM #4 (CRUSHER RUN)
GABION STONE

SURGE STONE

LIGHT STONE FILL

MEDIUM STONE FILL

HEAVY STONE FILL

COLARUSSO
$24.00 / TON
NO BID
$23.50 / TON
NO BID
NO BID
$23.25/ TON
$23.00/ TON
NO BID
$23.00/ TON
$20.50 / TON
$20.50 / TON
$21.50 / TON
$23.50/ TON
$23.00/ TON
NO BID
$29.00 / TON

$30.00/ TON

PECKHAM
$27.25/TON
$26.35/ TON

NO BID
$26.35/ TON
$26.35/ TON

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
$25.30/TON

NO BID

NO BID
$31.00/ TON
$41.25/TON

$41.25/TON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

COLD MIX ASPHALT (F.0.B.)

COLD MIX
HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX
COLD MIX 80 POUND BAG

HP COLD MIX 50 POUND BAG

COLD MIX ASPHALT DELIVERED

COLD MIX
HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX

HP COLD MIX 50 POUND BAG

** SUBJECT TO PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

(14.92 MILES) (27 MILES ) (28 MILES )}
B. METCALF COLARUSSO PECKHAM
NO BID NO BID $114.00 / TON**
$147.00/ TON NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
$8.00 / BAG NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
$155.00/ TON NO BID NO BID
$12.67 /| BAG NO BID NO BID

(40 MILES) (68.1 MILES )
PACKAGE GORMAN
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

ASPHALT MATERIAL PRICES (F.0.B.)

(10 MILES )

COLARUSSO - AMENIA

(27 MILES )

COLARUSSO - HUDSON

TYPE 1 HOT MIX ASPHALT
TYPE 3 HOT MIX ASPHALT
TYPE 5 HOT MIX ASPHALT
TYPE 6 HOT MIX ASPHALT
TYPE 7 HOT MIX ASPHALT
37.5 MM HOT MIX ASPHALT
25 MM HOT MIX ASPHALT
19 MM HOT MIX ASPHALT
12.5 MM HOT MIX ASPHALT
9.5 MM HOT MIX ASPHALT

MISC. PATCHING HMA

“* SUBJECT TO PRICE ADJUSTMENTS

NO BID
$74.00 / TON**
NO BID
$80.50 / TON**
$83.50 / TON**
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$79.00 / TON**
$85.00 / TON**

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
$86.50 / TON**
NO BID
NO BID
$59.50 / TON**
$61.50 / TON**
$63.00 / TON**
$67.50 / TON™
$71.50/ TON™

$74.00 / TON**

(28 MILES )
PECKHAM

$76.00 / TON**
$76.00 / TON**
NO BID
$80.00 / TON**
$84.00 / TON**
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

** SUBJECT TO ESCALATION / DE-ESCALATION

ROAD MATERIALS & EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES PECKHAM MATERIALS GORMAN BROS., INC.
CMS-2 NO BID NO BID
CRS-2 $3.05/ GALLON ** NO BID
CRS-2P $3.30 / GALLON ** NO BID
CSS-1H FOG SEAL $2.25/ GALLON ** NO BID
SELF-PROPELLED CHIP SPREADER $2,400.00 / DAY NO BID
RUBBER TIRE ROLLER WITH OPERATOR $2,050.00 / DAY NO BID
EQUIPMENT MOBILIZATION $650.00 / PER MOVE NO BID
DISTRIBUTOR WITH OPERATOR $250.00 / PER HOUR NO BID

LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE $1.20 / GALLON NO BID



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION BY SQUARE YARD

0"- 4"
5" g"
g i
13" - 15"
18" 15"

CALCIUM CHLORIDE

0" - 4"
5"-8"
9"- 12"
13"- 15"
15" 18"

CALCIUM CHLORIDE

PECKHAM ROAD CORP.

RECLAMATION / RECYCLING

$1.50 / SQUARE YARD
$1.55/ SQUARE YARD
$1.60 / SQUARE YARD
$1.65/ SQUARE YARD
$1.85/ SQUARE YARD

$1.75/ PER GALLON

RECLAMATION / RECYCLING

SHAPING, GRADING AND COMPACTING

GORMAN BROS.. INC.

RECLAMATION / RECYCLING
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

RECLAMATION / RECYCLING

SHAPING, GRADING AND COMPACTING

$3.15/ SQUARE YARD
$3.20 / SQUARE YARD
$3.25 / SQUARE YARD
$3.45/ SQUARE YARD
$3.85/ SQUARE YARD

$1.75/ PER GALLON

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

#2 FUEL OIL
DELIVERED

BOTTINI FUEL
CROWN ENERGY CORP.
HERRINGTON FUELS

TAYLOR OIL, INC.

9/12/2023
RACK
PER GALLON
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$3.28 / GALLON

CONSTANT
ADD-ON
PER GALLON
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$0.35/ GALLON

11

9/12/2023
PRICE
PER GALLON
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$3.63 / GALLON



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

9/12/2023 CONSTANT
87 OCTANE GASOLINE RACK ADD-ON
DELIVERED PER GALLON PER GALLON
BOTTINI FUEL NO BID NO BID
CROWN ENERGY CORP. NO BID NO BID
HERRINGTON FUELS NO BID NO BID

TAYLOR OIL, INC. $2.8625 / GAL. $0.38 / GAL.

12

9/12/2023
PRICE
PER GALLON
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$3.2425 | GAL.



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

9/12/2023 CONSTANT
ON ROAD RACK ADD-ON
DIESEL FUEL DELIVERED PER GALLON PER GALLON
BOTTINI FUEL NO BID NO BID
CROWN ENERGY CORP. NO BID NO BID
HERRINGTON FUELS NO BID NO BID

TAYLOR OIL, INC. $3.44/ GAL. $0.38 / GAL.

13

9/12/2023
PRICE

PER GALLON

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$3.82/ GAL.



TOWN OF NORTH EAST (2024 BIDS)

9/12/2023 CONSTANT
RACK ADD-ON

PROPANE DELIVERED PER GALLON PER GALLON
BOTTINI FUEL NO BID NO BID
CROWN ENERGY CORP. NO BID NO BID
HERRINGTON FUELS NO BID NO BID

TAYLOR PROPANE $1.88/ GAL. 30.40 / GAL.

TAYLOR PROPANE FIXED FIXED

14

9/12/2023
PRICE

PER GALLON

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
$2.28 / GAL.

$1.89/ GAL.



